Finance Committee Minutes

3/2/2021
1:30 PM

Conf Rm F and Zoom ID#6084719153

Meeting called by: Ray Steinke Note taker: Paul Bullock

Attendees: Bill Routley, Jerri Strong, Marilynn Bradstrom, Mindy Taylor
---------- Agenda Topics ----------

Call To Order 1:30 PM

Public Comment NONE

Housing Rehab Request Administrator

Discussion: The Committee reviewed a proposal from the BR Housing Commission for a rubber roof replacement. There

were three bids attached.

Conclusions: The Committee will recommend to the Board that the $19,300 bid from G Freeland Roofing, the

lowest of the three, be accepted.

Budget Amendment Request/Central Services Finance Officer

Discussion: The Committee reviewed a budget amendment request from the Finance Officer to amend the Central
Services budget by adding $8,500 from Unreserved Contingency 101 890-700 to the Prof/Contract Services line item 101-

248-813 to cover the new contract amount for IT Services with the City.

Conclusions: The Committee will recommend to the Board that the budget amendment be approved as presented.

Action items:

Amend the Budget

Person responsible:

Finance Officer

Deadline:

ther Business

NONE

Commissioner Per Diem and Travel

Discussion: The Committee reviewed and approved all Commissioner Per Diem and Travel.

Listed Bills
Discussion: The Committee reviewed all bills.

Conclusions: The Committee will recommend that all bills be paid.

Adjournment

1:58 PM
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Finance Committee Agenda

3/2/2021
1:30 PM
Conf Rm F and Zoom ID#6084719153

Meeting called by: Ray Steinke Note taker: Paul Bullock

Attendees: Bill Routley, Jerri Strong, Marilynn Bradstrom, Mindy Taylor
----- Agenda Topics -----

Call To Order

Public Comment

Housing Rehab Request Administrator

Budget Amendment Request/Central Services Finance Officer

Other Business
Commissioner Per Diem and Travel
Listed Bills

Adjournment




Marilynn Bradstrom
District #1

Jerrilynn Strong
District #2

Linda Howard
District #3

Raymond Steinke
District #4

Tom O’Neil
District #5

Wendy Nystrom
District #6

William Routley
District #7

Paul E. Bullock

Controller/Administrator

FC-1

CouNTtyYy OF MECOSTA

BoarRD oF COMMISSIONERS

400 ELM STREET, BIG RAPIDS, MI 49307
Phone (231) 796-2505 Fax (231) 592-0121
www.mecostacounty.org

To: Mecosta County Finance Committee
From: Paul Bullock, Administrator ‘/’%
Date:  March 1, 2021

Re: Housing Rehab Request

Attached please find a request from our Housing Administrator for permission to
proceed with a roof replacement.

Three quotes are included. The recommendation is that the $19,300 bid of G.
Freeland Roofing to be accepted, as they are the lowest bid and fully qualified.


emitchell
Text Box
FC - 1



30f18
Paul Bullock

From: Linda Miller

Sent: Thursday, February 25, 2021 9:16 AM
To: Paul Bullock

Subject: RE: Roof replacement

None whatsoever - they have repaired the rubber roof downtown at Nisbett-Fairman many times and they do good
work.

Linda Miller, Program Coordinator
Big Rapids Housing Commission
Phone: 231-796-8689

Fax: 231-796-8696

From: Paul Bullock <pbullock@mecostacounty.org>
Sent: Thursday, February 25, 2021 9:15 AM

To: Linda Miller <Imiller@bigrapidshousing.org>
Subject: RE: Roof replacement

| will take it to Finance next Tuesday. Do you have any concern with accepting the Freeland bid?

Paul E. Bullock
Controller/Administrator
Mecosta County, Michigan

From: Linda Miller <Imiller@bigrapidshousing.org>
Sent: Thursday, February 25, 2021 9:06 AM

To: Paul Bullock <pbullock@mecostacounty.org>
Subject: Roof replacement

Good morning Paul,

| have been working with Chris Shepherd for over six months on his roof. He has a rubber roof and finding quotes to
replace it has been near impossible, however, Chris finally got his 3rd quote the other day. He qualifies for the program
income wise, and the roof replacement is under the County's $30,000 limit, however, the low bid is $19,300 so | thought
| should get the County's approval first. The bids are attached and as follows:

G. Freeland Roofing $19,300
Kieff's Roofing $19,749
Naturashield $22,275

As you can see, G. Freeland's bid is not out of line with the other bids, however, | don't know a lot about rubber roofs so
| also asked Jess Arquette Builders to give a recommendation. Jess does not replace rubber roofs but he has replaced a
lot of roofs for the County (thru this program) as well as roofs on some of the properties that we own/manage.
Attached is Jess's recommendation, along with some photos of the roof damage.
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Chris and his wife both work at Schuberg's Bar and, therefore did not work a whole lot in 2020 due to COVID-19. I think
it would be great to help them out, so | would ask the County to consider approving this project.

If you have any questions, please let me know.
Linda

Linda Miller, Program Coordinator
Big Rapids Housing Commission
Phone: 231-796-8689

Fax: 231-796-8696

From: Big Rapids Housing Copier <bigrapidshousingcopier@bigrapidshousing.org>
Sent: Thursday, February 25, 2021 8:56 AM

To: Linda Miller <Imiller@bigrapidshousing.org>

Subject: Message from "RNP002673C742F3"

This E-mail was sent from "RNP002673C742F3" (MP C6502).

Scan Date: 02.25.2021 08:55:49 (-0500)
Queries to: bigrapidshousingcopier@bigrapidshousing.org



" 50f18

LUDINGTON, OFFICE
(231) 845-6322

417 E. Dowland St. « Ludington, MI 49431
Fax (231) 843-7161

" G. FREELAND ' Cadillac (231) 779-0404
i ; landroofing.
ROOFING SYSTEMS, INC. www.gfreelandroofing.net

HESIDENTIAL & COMMERCIAL & INDUSTRIAL Serving Ludington, Cadillac and all of Michigan!

September 15, 2020

Chris Shepherd
14925 Old Mill Pond Road
Big Rapids, Michigan 49307

Chris:
Here is the quote you requested for the property at the above-referenced address.

Scope of Work:

Remove existing rubber roof and }%4” recovery board.

Leave asphalt roof and insulation.

Install 1 %" polyisocyanurate insulation (R=8.5) mechanically attached.
Install 2x4 around entire perimeter to support new insulation.

Fully adhere 60 mil rubber roof to insulation.

Install 24-gauge Kynar-finished metal trim to outside edges.

Protect home and landscaping.

Haul all demo to an approved landfill.

Price for this Work: $19,300.00
Should you have any questions, please feel free to call our office. Thank you.
Respectfully submitted,

(/C oA /)1{21,/7 —{_ A/]//”W ﬁ) D//L(/ﬁ[ﬂ( ﬁ/%/
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Kieff's Roofing, Inc.

121E, Coral Rd.

Stanton, Ml 48888

(989) 762-5073 - P (989) 762-5115 - Fax
kieffsroofing@cmsinter.net

DATE  June 23, 2020

EXPIRATION DATE 30 Days

TO Chris Shepherd

14925 Old Millpond Rd.
Big Rapids, M} 49307
(231) 250-4183 i

!

Brad ' . 1/2 payment to start; balance on completion

Roof Est

Remove old roofng & dlSpOSE

Vi } -1 1/2" |so mecha ached

. 35 _ _ .
35 " sq. GOmllEPDMrubber fullyadhered " $8,40000 |

-] 3 ;s"RTs Lo ‘
12 Cft. ' Termbar - ) ‘ . ;

7 .ea. Ope mgstoﬂash

285 . Dot 3"LMetal(brown) L $214500

25 { ea. ’ CDrnerﬂash(ngs ) ) 550000 !

1 ! ea. . Chlmneytoﬂash

. $1'5

290 ’ ft. 2x4 Naller $653 00 :
| ;

This quete is for compledng the job desedbed above, based on o eraluation. It does not include any wnforseen price inereases or additional libor or TOTAL :

materials which may be required should problems asse, G e e

There is NO warranty on repair work,

Owner iy responsible far abtaining budding permuts (if applicable).

Owucr iy responsible for re-programming satellite/intevact dishes. .

"T'a replace any bud OSB, there & wn addimvnal charge — S63.00 per sheet for 7/16 USB & §75400 pec sheet far 1/2 OSB
T replace any bad baards, the cor 2.50 lneal ft,

Credit cards accepted (additional charges apply)  Financig avsilible thraugh Green Sky (additional charges apply)

T uccepr thus quaration, sizn & date here and rerurn:

Acceptance:

Date:

THANK YOU FOR YOUR BUSINESS!
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NacurashieLD
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12/4/12

To General Contractor: 14925 Old Mill Pond Rd

We hereby submit to provide material, labor, tools and equipment to install roofing and sheet-metal trim per your
request and the cope below for the 14925 Old Mill Pond Rd project located in Big Rapids, MI.

Section Roofing

« Complete removal and lawful disposal of all roofing and related flashings for installation of new roofing
system
o Note that damaged decking will be replaced at an extra cost of $5 per sq ft to match
like and kind
«  Roof system including wall, curb and penetration flashings
o Install 2" coverboard to decking
o Install adhered 60 mil EPDM roof membrane and flashings
« Provide owner with Contractor’s 2-year Workmanship Warranty
« Provide owner with Manufacturer’s 20-year Total System Warranty

Section Sheet Metal Flashing and Trim

e 24-gauge edge metal at all perimeters

Labor, material, tax, insurance and clean up associated to this proposal for the sum of............ $ 22,275.00

1501 Madison Ave SE e Grand Rapids, MI 49503 e (844) 667-3267 o naturashield.com
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Exclusions:
Installation of structural decking or any connection assemblies not specifically called out above.
Accepting the physical properties or attachment of structural decking and/or its moisture content.

Any and all vapor and moisture barriers, weather barriers, sheet waterproofing, or fluid-applied waterproofing and £
patching thereof.

Any expansion joint assemblies not associated with the above work.

No wood blocking of any kind.

*Note: walkway pad available at a rate of $25 per linear foot.

Dave Pipenger Operations Manager (616) 644-2686 dpipenger@naturashield.com

The above rates exclude disconnecting and/or supporting equipment, ceilings, or other items that are attached to
the underside of the roof deck and cleanup of particulate or debris as a result of tear off or deck replacement, which
can only be done on a time and materials agreement. All rooftop accessories including, but not limited to, heat tape
and electrical conduit are to be removed, and re applied by a certified electrician or an individual appointed by the
Owner. NaturaShield is not responsible for any damage that ensues from failing to do so.

NaturaShield shall not be responsible for disturbance, damage, clean up or loss to interior property that Owner did
not remove or protect prior to commencement of roofing operations. The owner shall notify tenants of the re-roofing
or repair efforts and the need to provide protection underneath areas affected by the re-roofing operations.

Terms and Conditions: Any deviations from the above specifications involving extra costs will be executed only ;,‘
upon written orders and will be an extra charge over and above the estimate. All agreements contingent upon strikes, i
accidents or delays beyond our control. Owners to carry fire, tornado and other necessary insurance on above work. [
30% due at contract signing with the remainder due in weekly progress payments throughout the duration of the
project. 7% monthly late fee will apply to all outstanding balances. Debtor agrees to pay all collection costs and
attorney fees associated with the outstanding balance. This proposal may be withdrawn if not accepted within 30
days. Project to be scheduled upon signing of proposal and submission of down payment.

Acceptance of proposal: The above prices, specifications and conditions are satisfactory and are hereby accepted.
You are authorized to do the work as specified. Payment will be made as outlined above. If for any reason building
owner or representative cancels this contract, they will be subject to a restocking charge and cancellation fees.

1501 Madison Ave SE e Grand Rapids, MI 49503 e (844) 667-3267 e naturashield.com
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VOUCHER

COUNTY OF MECOSTA
Date 2-2Y-204/

Commissioners

Pay to: S\'\C\Fcﬂ’.\ /\)JO\”\O\OL(‘C’
19955 b Mile Ad
Stanw oe A_', ML {93 J b

DATE . [TEMS , ANMOUNT
2-g92-208 | AAAWM  (Zoon) 2560

TOTAL 25,00

Charge to: Per Diem

Account #: 101 101 705.000
It is hereby certified that the above account is
true and correct and that no part of the same

%;;@ has been paid.
g Hesen Bargord
%;@ A ' Yiolen D ong AL,
\E?’ra ~ \-:\;L ¥ p i‘;’ S Signe\d . O

%\\Y‘& ) Py b @Fé» Q
e | (/O.

2OPeS
@@
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3o 18 VOUCHER

COUNTY OF MECOSTA

Commissioners Date 2 ~2é 222

Pay to: (0N (ij MLIS\H?) AN

DATE ITEMS AMOUNT
d-23-z02l | OHHS  Wedckins 95 00
2-25-22(sdo/i (f nganizedn Enderprise. 25, 00

7 ! .
Flect Uk/\a/\a{jﬂ.;mg st ’[?frf §CJ/HLK:‘)Q'(’/ U

TOTAL So-ad
Charge to: Per Diem
Account #: 101 101 705.000
Finance Committee Approval — It is hereby certified that the above account is
true and correct and that no part of the same
has been paid.
J (J&C—\ .
Wy 5=
[} Signed ' _
. @
(CS eV~
A YL 4
\%g a\ A
' VY @ .
\?\]\\\5_2\:‘;"‘- /Q@ ©\‘ @ ;&‘f/
« DX \Q?&\g\"!’
%@?\g%‘%
-:(;@%\
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COUNTY OF MECOSTA

Commissioners Date A ~ 26 - 31

Pay to: Ray Steinke

DATE ITEMS AMOUNT
SN Fingmie 25,00
9-Y Al O AS.09
A -6 AL Cing Iy A5. 0o
218 "9 EmS 25-0¢)

1-/%-2 ) Consy s 35.00
TOTAL |3 —
Charge to: Per Diem
Account #: 101 101 705.000

It is hereby certified that the above account is true
and correct and that no part of the same has been

. paid. - .
& By St

@@ B {&‘\ﬁ\ & Signed
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VOUCHER

COUNTY OF MECOSTA

Commissioners Date 24-Feb-21

Pay to: Jerrilynn Strong
District 2 County Commissioner
1137 17 Mile Road
Remus, Michigan 49340

DATE ITEMS ANMOUNT
1/7/2021 COMMISSIONER MEETING $25.00
1/12/2021 ROAD COMMISSION $25.00
1/19/2021 FINANCE $25.00
1/21/2021 COMMISSIONER MEETING $25.00

TOTAL $100.00
Charge to: Per Diem
Account #: 101 101 705.000

Binapos Commlﬁ%Approva! It is hereby certified that the above account is

Q, true and correct and that no pari_a
qé N & has been paid. )
S o & —
@Q/ \3:\ Y Q‘é&ég "\_),(’/LWQ.{?V,V/
Qg’ <<8}v Qq?g;?@ §{gned j
llv % @
&
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TRAVEL VOUCHER
COUNTY OF MECOSTA

Department: Date: 2/24/2021

Pay to: Jerrilynn Strong
District 2 Counly Commissioner
1137 17 Mile Road
Remus, Michigan 49340

Date From To Reason for Travel Miles Traveled
1/12/2021|HOME BIG RAPIDS ROAD COMMISSION 25
1/2472021|BIG RAPIDS HOME ROAD COMMISSION 25

Y

Lodging

Parking/Meals Event Amount
Total Other $0.00
TOTAL MILES 50
Charge to: X 0.56
trre— i imhursement MILEAGE TOTAL $28.00
|aser-tine-itemii-Conference-Expensa Meals/Parking Total $0.00

gr E %7[/ {\_) Total Reimbursement $28.00

It is hereby certified that the above a ounl i

‘O L - [Ol ,_g lD -OOD Atatno part of the same has been pa|
__/(_/W/Z,C/[,,m /

ned Emp!oyee

9
¢
€
@ ({%E, ,C Qgg"“j
X %Ui%%
%&\‘

K,.v'

Signed  Authorizing Departmeni Head
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VOUCHER

COUNTY OF MECOSTA

Commissioners

Pay to: </ w227 @ // j—/’-//

Date )”8- /9 - )7/

DATE ITEMS AMOUNT
/- /S S Wy o A FAS. 2D
/=] = H/ J.oC, HAs~, 20
[/~ A/ Z.oC, Hds , 20
4- . 7- 2/ S Hori ¥ b N2l A A4~ we
A=/ =9/ Lo, Jd 35,00

ju//az ‘€wle € o-Z ON PN

g ,/,de ez P

-1 92/ <oyt ’ S A5 oo
X-15- A/ S oC, YTy

TOTALY 7 0 . &0
Charge to: Per Diem '

Account #:

101 101 705.000

It is hereby certified that the above account is true
and correct and that no part of the same has been

paid.

Signed

S Vo /4
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© VOUCHER

COUNTY OF MECOSTA

Commissioners Date &-1=- Zoz(

Pay to: U luﬂc[tj ;\} J{yg%/ S

DATE ITEMS AMOUNT
I~ F~2e2f Youwth Adendivey Cender W Bownd Plectde |P2600
Ve Agvintee o Jrof a7t by -
A~ - o2 P \divng 4 2 onine Camwwc Mee $ 25 0o

21820 |Ronred O [ optalincioncss theeling 1 J6.00

TOTAL g 15 0O

Chargde to: Per Diem
Account #: 101 101 705.000
Finance Committee Approval - It is hereby certified that the above account is

true and correct and that no part of the same
has been paid.

igned VAP ,
l Signe / @\5 \E %@
Oi @€ W
C 0 o @%@@%‘

DY Y
7“@?\\";\@




VOUCHER

COUNTY OF MECOSTA

Commissioners Date 2/25/2021

Pay to: LINDA HOWARD

DATE ITEMS AMOUNT
1/7/2021 Co Comm $25.00
1/21/2021 Bldg & Zoning $25.00
1/21/2021 Co Comm $25.00
2/4/2021 Co Comm $25.00
2/18/2021 Bldg & Zoning $25.00
2/18/2021 Co Comm $25.00
2/25/2021 Mid Mich Comm Action $25.00

TOTAL $175.00
Charge to: Per Diem
Account #: 101 101 705.000
It is hereby certified that the above account is true
@@ and correct and that no part of the same has been
gﬂ\\i = paid.
¢C W .
& A of 52 Linda Howard
""?‘.ff“d'; @Vi\é\Q‘\ Signed
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