

AWARDED TO:

DATE AWARDED:

**BID TABULATIONS**  
**FOR**  
**DISPOSAL OF RUBBISH AND STREET SWEEPINGS**  
**OPENING DATE: JUNE 25, 2020**

	<b>Rumpke</b> <b>3990 Generations Dr.</b> <b>Cincinnati, Ohio 45251</b> <b>1-800-828-8171</b> <b>William J. Rumpke, Jr.</b>	<b>Kimble</b> <b>3596 State Rt. 39 NW</b> <b>Dover, Ohio 44622</b> <b>330-343-1226</b> <b>Don Johnson</b>	<b>Waste Management</b> <b>6705 Richmond Road</b> <b>Glenwillow, Ohio 44139</b> <b>Vince Crawford</b>
<b>NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT</b>	Signed	Signed	NO BID
<b>ACKNOWLEDGEMENT AGREEMENT</b>	Signed	Signed	
<b>CHECK/BOND</b>	Bond	Bond	
<b>BID PROPOSAL SIGNED</b>	Signed	Signed	
<b>BID GUARANTEE</b>			
<b>BID PROPOSAL – DISPOSAL OF RUBBISH</b>			
<b>One Year Contract – First Year Per Cubic Yard</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>Per Ton</b>	\$43.15	\$37.40	No Bid
			No Bid
<b>Two Year Contract – First Year Per Cubic Yard</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>Per Ton</b>	\$43.15	\$37.40	No Bid
<b>Second Year – Per Cubic Yard</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>Per Ton</b>	\$43.15	\$38.52	No Bid

AWARDED TO:

DATE AWARDED:

**BID TABULATIONS**  
**FOR**  
**DISPOSAL OF RUBBISH AND STREET SWEEPINGS**  
**OPENING DATE: JUNE 25, 2020**

	Rumpke	Kimble	Waste Management
<b>Three Year Contract – First Year Per Cubic Yard</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>Per Ton</b>	\$43.15	\$37.40	No Bid
<b>Second Year Per Cubic Yard</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>Per Ton</b>	\$43.15	\$38.52	No Bid
<b>Third Year Per Cubic Yard</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>Per Ton</b>	\$44.40	\$39.68	No Bid
<b>BID PROPOSAL – STREET SWEEPINGS &amp; VACTOR DISPOSAL</b>			
<b>One Year Contract – First Year Per Cubic Yard</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>Per Ton</b>	\$45.15	\$39.40	No Bid
<b>Two Year Contract – First Year Per Cubic Yard</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>Per Ton</b>	\$45.15	\$39.40	No Bid
<b>Second Year – Per Cubic Yard</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>Per Ton</b>			

AWARDED TO:

DATE AWARDED:

**BID TABULATIONS**  
**FOR**  
**DISPOSAL OF RUBBISH AND STREET SWEEPINGS**  
**OPENING DATE: JUNE 25, 2020**

	Rumpke	Kimble	Waste Management
<b>Three Year Contract – First Year Per Cubic Yard</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>Per Ton</b>	\$45.15	\$39.40	No Bid
<b>Second Year Per Cubic Yard</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>Per Ton</b>	\$45.15	\$40.58	No Bid
<b>Third Year Per Cubic Yard</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>Per Ton</b>	\$46.45	\$41.80	No Bid