

Bid No. 21-41
Town of Groton, Connecticut 06340
4/21/2021
2:30 PM

RFP PPE Supplies Materials & Equipment

Vendors

Connect6 Group Inc
150 North Michigan Ave. #800
Chicago, IL 60601
Andrew Yousefpour
613-558-9594
andrew.yousefpour@connect6
roup.com

United Medco Inc
4250 Coral Ridge Dr
Coral Springs, FL 33065
Nick DiMauro
561-715-1096
ndimauro@unitedmedco.co
m

Connecticut Mask Company
262 MP Quarry Rd
Milford, CT 06460
David Hoffman
203-829-8285
dhoffman@ctmaskco.com

Modern Plastics
88 Long Hill Cross Rd
Shelton, CT 06484
Joseph Amarante
203-333-3128
sales@modernplastics.com

Qyk Brands LLC
12101 Western Ave
Garden Grove, CA 92841
Vipin Sattu
917-689-6246
rpf@gyk.us

Item	Description	Quantity	Unit	E	1	E	2	E	3	E	4	E	5	E
A	PPE SUPPLIES													
1.	Surgical Masks 3 ply; elastic ear loops; metal nose strip	200,000	ea				\$0.05		\$0.15		\$0.20		no bid	\$0.06
2.	N-95 Masks 3M 9210 fold flat	50,000	ea				no bid		\$0.75		no bid		no bid	\$3.35
3.	Nitril Gloves Exam Grade Nitril S,M L, EL sizes	27,500	ea size				\$0.14		\$0.14		no bid		no bid	no bid
4	Rubbing Alcohol (16 oz) 70% Isopropyl	1500	ea				no bid		\$2.25		no bid		no bid	\$3.50
5	Hand Sanitizer Gel (8OZ) Purell or approved eq	2000	ea				no bid		\$2.25	E	no bid		no bid	\$2.85
6	Face Shields Protective, disposal, antifog	12,500	ea				\$0.73		\$0.75		no bid		\$0.50	E
B	CLEANING SUPPLIES													
7	Clorox wipes (75/CAN)	2000	ea				no bid		\$4.99	E	no bid		no bid	\$3.50
8	Viricide Cleaner (5gal) SDS Required Shockwave RTU or approved equal	10	ea				no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid	\$65.00
9	Spray bottles 16 oz	1000	ea				no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid	\$1.45
10	Lysol Disinfectant spray. 19 oz	1000	ea				no bid		\$6.99		no bid		no bid	\$2.89
11	Paper Towels(30 per case)	50	case				no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid	no bid
C	FIRST RESPONDER SUPPLIES													
12	Tyvek Suits with hoods s,m, l, xl, 2xl)	40	Ea size				no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid	no bid
13	PAPR Full Face Respirators 3m Versaflo PAPR TR-600 or equal; Include 2 HEPA/Vapor cartridges per respirator	5	ea				no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid	no bid
14	6 Mill Polyethylene sheeting (10'x100' roll)	10	roll				no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid	no bid
15	Duct Tape	100	roll				no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid	no bid
16	Heavy Duty trash bags (55-Gal x 50 bags/case)	20	case				no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid	no bid
17	Biological HAZMAT disposal bags(200 CASE)	5	case				no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid	no bid
D	Equipment Required for Storage and Distribution													
18	Steel Heavy Duty Shelving racks 36wx18dx72 - 4 shelf units	3	ea				no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid	no bid
19	Hand Truck-continuous loop 10" solid rubber tires 800# cap	1	ea				no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid	no bid
20	Traffic cones, Heavy duty 24" reflective	25	ea				no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid	no bid
21	Caution Tape 300' roll	5	ea				no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid	no bid
22	Distribution Bags for materials Recycled paper 16" x6" x19" 60lb paper handles	1000	ea				no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid	no bid

Required documents submitted:

Bidder Information Forms (2)	Yes	Yes	yes	yes	yes
References	Yes	Yes	yes	yes	yes
Debarment or Suspension Form	Yes	Yes	yes	yes	yes
Receipt of Addendum	Blank	Blank	yes	Blank	yes
Review Insurance	Yes	Yes	yes	yes	yes
ETA after receipt of PO	7-10 days	7 days	2 weeks	immediate	3 to 5 days
Non-Collusion Affidavit	yes	yes	yes	yes	yes
Non-Collusion Affidavit of Subcontractor	Yes	yes	yes	yes	yes
Affirmative Action/Equal Opportunity	yes (not on letterhead)	yes (not on letterhead)	yes	yes	yes (not on letterhead)
Certification of Bidder EEO	yes	yes	yes	yes	yes
Certification of Non-Segregated Facilities	yes	yes	yes	yes	yes
Exceptions to Specifications	form submitted	form submitted	page not submitted	form submitted	form submitted
Duplicate Copy Sent	no	no	yes	no	no

True Vision Companies LLC 1101 Wootton Pkwy S #400 Rockville, MD 20852 Aji Eapen 301-375-4106 aeapen@truevisiontech.com				Deepka Import LLC 340 Cambridge Dr Union, NJ 07083 Anmole Bhandari info@medmart32.com				Ly Electronics USA Inc 7707 Fannin S#200 Houston, TX 77054 Lily Xiong 832-247-4267 lily@lyelectronicsusa.com				Empire Medical and Dental Supplies Inc 320 Roebling St S #330 Brooklyn, NY 11211 Faigy Schwartz 718-532-4112 faigy@empiredentalsupplies.com				PPE Global Health 1022 Lancaster Ave Bryn Mawr, PA 19010 Scott Latham 215-730-7990 scott@ppeglobalhealth.com				American Mask Alliance Inc 428 S Zelta St Wichita, KS 67207 Nick Bennington 316-737-6163 nick.bennington@americanmaskalliance.com				EMS Innovations 7992 Crain Hwy Glen Burnie, MD 21061 Ashley Lesniewski 410-255-3314 alesniewski@emsinnovations.com				Government MLO Supplies USA Inc 7939 Norfolk Ave S# 201 Bethesda, MD 20814 Zak Elyasi 571-285-6834 zak.elyasi@governmentmlosupplier.com			
13	E	14	E	15	E	16	E	17	E	18	E	19	E	20	E																
0.17		0.34		0.1		0.04		0.04		0.07		0.28		0.15																	
2.25		1.50	E	no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		2.3	E	1.05	E																
0.18		0.16		0.256		15.00		0.17		no bid		.40/pr S&M; .35/pr L&XL		no bid																	
no bid		4.50		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid																	
no bid		2.80		no bid		2.25		1.29		no bid		3	E	8.95	E																
1.60		2.00		0.9		1.50		0.90		1.25		2	E	no bid																	
11.50		no bid		no bid		6.75		no bid		no bid		8	E	no bid																	
no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		15	E	no bid																	
no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		4.5		no bid																	
9.50		15.00	E	no bid		12.75		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid																	
no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		8		no bid																	
no bid		10.00		no bid		2.45		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid																	
no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid																	
no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		65		no bid																	
no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		8		no bid																	
no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		70	E	no bid																	
no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		70	E	no bid																	
no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		400	E	no bid																	
no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		185		no bid																	
no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		35	E	no bid																	
no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		8		no bid																	
no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		0.9		no bid																	
yes		yes		yes		yes		yes		yes		yes		yes																	
yes		yes		yes		yes		yes		yes		yes		yes																	
yes		yes		yes		yes		yes		yes		yes		yes																	
blank		yes		yes		yes		blank		yes		yes		no																	
blank		yes		yes		yes		yes		yes		yes		yes																	
5 business days		2-3 weeks		2-4 weeks		5-7 days		3 business days		30 days		10-14 days		asap																	
no		yes		yes		yes		yes		yes		yes		yes																	
no		no		no		no		yes		yes		yes		yes																	
no		yes		yes		yes		yes (not on letterhead)		yes		yes		yes (not on letterhead)																	
no		yes		yes		yes		yes		yes		yes		yes																	
no		yes		yes		yes		yes		yes		yes		yes																	
form submitted		form submitted		form submitted		form submitted		Form submitted		form submitted		form submitted		form submitted																	
yes		no		no		no		yes		yes		no		no																	

Ever Ready First Aid & Medical Supply
 300 Liberty Ave
 Brooklyn, NY 11207
 Miri Weber
 718-495-4600
 mweber@everreadygroup.com

Rip Clear LLC
 3440 78th St Unit 2H
 Jackson Heights, NY 11372
 Jeffery Whalen
 248-798-9710
 jeff@ripclear.com

Double Eagle Procurement LLC
 37 Fairlawn Dr
 North Haven, CT 06473
 Kevin Kelly
 203-989-7337
 kkelly512@comcast.net

Acuity Specialty Products Inc dba Zep Sales and Services
 3330 Cumberland Pkwy S# 700
 Atlanta, GA 30339
 Maureena Fabien-Watson
 877-428-9937
 zepbids@zep.com

Medical Shipment LLC
 8060 Saint Louis Ave
 Skokie, IL 60076
 Daniel Micic
 847-253-3000
 dan@medicalshipment.com

Strong Manufacturers
 11519 Nations Ford Rd S#100
 Pineville, NC 28134
 Charles Fatora
 716-626-9400
 orders@strongmanufacturers.com

Pristine Dental Supplies Inc
 871 Marlborough Ave #101
 Riverside, CA 92507
 Mosammet Akhter
 562-606-9141
 mdin@pristinedentalsupply.com

29	E	30	E	31	E	32	E	33	E	34	E	35	E
0.06		0.03		0.18		no bid		0.49		0.035		0.08	
1.90	E	no bid		1.26	E	no bid		1.49	E			1.99	
0.18		no bid		0.25		no bid		199.00		0.14755	E	0.35	
1.90		no bid		1.59		no bid		2.49				2.59	
3.50	E	no bid		3.36	E	1.90	E	2.29	E			2.75	
1.54		0.18		2.02		no bid		0.79				0.7	
10.90		4.00	E	5.68	E	4.34	E	no bid				12.99	
no bid		no bid		128.35		43.33	E	no bid				no bid	
no bid		no bid		2.25		2.40	E	no bid				10.99	E
9.9	E	no bid		4.34	E	4.00	E	9.99				no bid	
1.75		no bid		1.08		no bid		1.49				1.59	
4.50		no bid		7.66		no bid		no bid				no bid	
no bid		no bid		1792.28		no bid		no bid				no bid	
no bid		no bid		37.91		no bid		no bid				no bid	
5.00		no bid		4.73		no bid		no bid				no bid	
26.00		no bid		0.83		no bid		no bid				no bid	
no bid		no bid		0.14		no bid		no bid				15.99	
no bid		no bid		142.81		no bid		no bid				no bid	
no bid		no bid		62.63		no bid		no bid				no bid	
no bid		no bid		13.19		no bid		no bid				no bid	
7.00		no bid		3.67		no bid		no bid				no bid	
no bid		no bid		0.99		no bid		no bid				no bid	
yes		yes		yes		yes		yes		yes		yes	
yes		yes		yes		yes		yes		yes		yes	
yes		yes		yes		yes		yes		yes		yes	
no		no		yes		yes		no		yes		yes	
yes		yes		yes		yes		yes		yes		yes	
blank		4 business days		2-3 weeks		7-10 days		3 weeks		7 days		7 days	
no		yes (not notarized)		yes		no		yes		yes		yes	
no		no		yes		no		yes		yes		yes	
no		yes		no		yes (not on letterhead)		yes		yes		yes	
no		yes		yes		no		yes		yes		yes	
no		yes		yes		no		yes		yes		yes	
form submitted		form submitted		form submitted		form submitted		form submitted		form submitted		form submitted	
no		yes		yes		no		yes		yes		no	

Tu Brands Inc 100 E 10th Ct Hialeah, FL 33010 Carlos Arias 305-374-8967 egranados@tubrands.com		UniPak Corp PO Box 300027 Brooklyn, NY 11230 Brian Marcus 888-808-5120 customercare@unipakcorp.net		LubeMatrix Inc 913 Harrison St Madison, WI 53711 Bruce Moncrieff 414-339-2980 bruce@lubematrix.com		Atlantic Trading Company 5900 Balcones Dr S# 4031 Austin, TX 78731 Trent Todd 512-280-9157 trent@atl-trading.com		Mini Wing USA 2516 Via Tejon S# 307 Pls Vrds Est, CA 90274 Matt Huang 424-558-3867 matt@miniwinghealth.com		Evolved By Nature Inc 196 Boston Ave S# 1100 Medford, MA 02155 Rebecca Lacouture 609-937-2932 cole.morokhovich@evolvedbynature.com		Medsential LLC 1136 S 3600 W S# 400 Salt Lake City, UT 84104 Chiao-ih Hui 801-414-8041 chiaoh@medsential.com		Think 360 Incorporated 5335 Dividend Dr S #A Decatur, GA 30035 Angela Sant'anna 678-336-1534 angela.santana@think360.us	
36	E	37	E	38	39	E	40	E	41	E	42	E	43	E	
0.031		0.03		0.05		0.23		0.10		no bid		0.25 E		0.11 E	
no bid		1.20 E		1.45		2.99 E		0.7985		no bid		no bid		1.62 E	
no bid		0.144		0.16		0.42		0.18		no bid		no bid		no bid	
no bid		1.60		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid	
2.21 E		0.83		1.86		2.39 E		no bid		no bid		no bid		1.51 E	
0.27		0.43		0.55		1.39		0.50		no bid		2.65 E		1.10	
no bid		6.60		4.96		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid	
no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid	
3.313		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid	
no bid		6.60		10.45		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid	
no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid	
no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid	
no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid	
no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid	
no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid	
no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid	
no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid	
no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid	
no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid	
no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid	
no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid	
no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid	
no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid	
no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid	
no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid	
no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid	
yes		yes		yes		yes		yes		yes		yes		yes	
yes		yes		yes		yes		yes		yes		yes		yes	
yes		yes		yes		yes		yes		yes		yes		yes	
yes		no		yes		yes		no		yes		no		no	
yes		yes		yes		yes		yes		yes		yes		yes	
5-10 days		1-10 days		10 days		14 days		30-45 days		1 week		5-7 days		2-5 weeks	
yes		yes		yes		yes		yes		no		yes		no	
no		yes		yes		no		yes		no		yes		no	
yes		yes (not on letterhead)		yes		yes (not on letterhead)		yes		yes		yes (not on letterhead)		no	
yes		yes		yes		yes		yes		no		yes		no	
yes		yes		yes		yes		yes		no		yes		no	
form submitted		form submitted		form submitted		form not submitted		form submitted		form submitted		form submitted		form submitted	
no		yes		yes		yes		no		yes		yes		yes	

Horizon Tool Inc
7918 Industrial Village Rd
Greensboro, NC 27409
Margaret Kenny
800-537-1077
margaretkenny@calvantools.net

Cintas Corporation
6800 Cintas Blvd
Mason, OH
Aaron Ghiroli
203-464-7857
ghirolia@cintas.com

Tactical Police Gear LLC
1555 Highland Ave
Cheshire, CT 06410
Valdemar Queiroga
203-464-8992
val@tactical-police-gear.com

K & F Drug Corp
41-16 Main St
Flushing, NY 11355
Yanfei Xu
929-990-6651
bid@starsidedrugs.com

Panacea Life Sciences Inc
5910 S University Blvd S #C18-193
Greenwood Village, CO 80121
Leslie Buttorff
303-434-0215
leslie.buttorff@panacealife.com

BT West Supplies
451 Mirror Ct #103
Henderson, NV 89011
Allen Hiller
702-678-4667
victoria@BTSuppliesLV.com

52	E	53	E	54	E	55	E	56	E	57	E
no bid		0.10		no bid		0.05		0.06		0.12	
no bid		2.95		no bid		1.80 E		0.45 E		3.25	
no bid		0.28		no bid		0.15		0.13 E		17.50	
no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid	
1.63 E		6.50 E		1.92 E		0.90 E		2.29 E		1.75 E	
no bid		no bid		2.50		0.60		2.99		2.25	
no bid		no bid		no bid		8.00		2.49 E		5.00	
no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid	
1.05		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid	
no bid		no bid		no bid		12.00		no bid		no bid	
no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid	
no bid		no bid		no bid		800.00		no bid		8.00	
no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid	
no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid	
no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid	
no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid	
no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid	
no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid		no bid	
yes		yes		yes		yes		yes		yes	
yes		yes		yes		yes		yes		yes	
yes		yes		yes		yes		yes		yes	
yes		yes		yes		no		yes		yes	
no		yes		yes		yes		yes		yes	
3-5 days		days		30-45 days		15 days		3-7 business days		3 business days	
no		no		no		yes		yes		no	
no		no		no		no		no		no	
no		no		no		yes (not on letterhead)		yes		no	
no		no		no		yes		yes		no	
no		no		no		yes		yes		no	
form submitted		form submitted		form submitted		form submitted		form submitted		form submitted	
no		no		yes		no		yes		yes	