

	<b>Vendor</b>		<b>Vendor</b>
<b>Address:</b>	TruGreen 30 Access Rd Warwick, RI 02886		SeaScape Lawn Care 1610 Flat River Rd Coventry, RI 02816
<b>Contact</b>	Brian Banner		Mike Ventura
<b>Telephone #</b>	508-962-3785		401-821-7300
<b>Email Address:</b>	<a href="mailto:brianbanner@trugreenmail.com">brianbanner@trugreenmail.com</a>		<a href="mailto:mikev.seascapeinc@gmail.com">mikev.seascapeinc@gmail.com</a>
<b>Receipt of Addendum</b>	yes		not noted
<b>Reviewed insurance</b>	yes		not noted
<b>Exceptions:</b>	no		form not completed
<b>References</b>	not noted		yes
<b>Estimated Delivery ARO:</b>	30 days or less		3 business days
<b>Location</b>	<b>April 2021 - March 31, 2022</b>		
Burrows Little League 140 South Rd, Groton, CT	\$199.00		\$195.00
Farquhar Park Gales Ferry Rd, Groton, CT	\$249.00		\$715.00
Poquonnock Plains Park 150 Fort Hill Rd, Groton, CT	\$2,456.00		\$3,210.00
Sutton Field both ball fields in rear 185 Fort Hill Rd, Groton, CT	\$470.00		\$545.00
Sutton Park Entrance 185 Fort Hill Rd, Groton, CT	\$240.00		\$115.00
<b>Total</b>	<b>\$3,614.00</b>		<b>\$4,780.00</b>
Groton Senior Center & Groton Public Library *102 & 52 Newtown Rd, Groton, CT *optional	\$240.00		no bid
<b>Location</b>	<b>April 1, 2022 - March 31, 2023</b>		
Burrows Little League 140 South Rd, Groton, CT	\$199.00		\$204.00
Farquhar Park Gales Ferry Rd, Groton, CT	\$249.00		\$744.00
Poquonnock Plains Park 150 Fort Hill Rd, Groton, CT	\$2,456.00		\$3,339.00
Sutton Field both ball fields in rear 185 Fort Hill Rd, Groton, CT	\$470.00		\$567.00
Sutton Park Entrance 185 Fort Hill Rd, Groton, CT	\$240.00		\$120.00
<b>Total</b>	<b>\$3,614.00</b>		<b>\$4,974.00</b>
Groton Senior Center & Groton Public Library *102 & 52 Newtown Rd, Groton, CT *optional	\$240.00		no bid
<b>Location</b>	<b>April 1, 2023 - March 31, 2024</b>		

Burrows Little League 140 South Rd, Groton, CT	\$199.00		\$213.00
Farquhar Park Gales Ferry Rd, Groton, CT	\$249.00		\$774.00
Poquonnock Plains Park 150 Fort Hill Rd, Groton, CT	\$2,456.00		\$3,474.00
Sutton Field both ball fields in rear 185 Fort Hill Rd, Groton, CT	\$470.00		\$589.00
Sutton Park Entrance 185 Fort Hill Rd, Groton, CT	\$240.00		\$125.00
<b>Total</b>	<b>\$3,614.00</b>		<b>\$5,175.00</b>
Groton Senior Center & Groton Public Library *102 & 52 Newtown Rd, Groton, CT *optional	\$240.00		no bid
<b>Location</b>	<b>April 1, 2024 - March 31, 2025</b>		
Burrows Little League 140 South Rd, Groton, CT	\$199.00		\$222.00
Farquhar Park Gales Ferry Rd, Groton, CT	\$249.00		\$805.00
Poquonnock Plains Park 150 Fort Hill Rd, Groton, CT	\$2,456.00		\$3,613.00
Sutton Field both ball fields in rear 185 Fort Hill Rd, Groton, CT	\$470.00		\$613.00
Sutton Park Entrance 185 Fort Hill Rd, Groton, CT	\$240.00		\$130.00
<b>Total</b>	<b>\$3,614.00</b>		<b>\$5,383.00</b>
Groton Senior Center & Groton Public Library *102 & 52 Newtown Rd, Groton, CT *optional	\$240.00		no bid
<b>Location</b>	<b>April 1, 2025 - March 31, 2026</b>		
Burrows Little League 140 South Rd, Groton, CT	\$210.00		\$231.00
Farquhar Park Gales Ferry Rd, Groton, CT	\$275.00		\$838.00
Poquonnock Plains Park 150 Fort Hill Rd, Groton, CT	\$2,700.00		\$3,757.00
Sutton Field both ball fields in rear 185 Fort Hill Rd, Groton, CT	\$470.00		\$637.00
Sutton Park Entrance 185 Fort Hill Rd, Groton, CT	\$250.00		\$135.00
<b>Total</b>	<b>\$3,905.00</b>		<b>\$5,598.00</b>
Groton Senior Center & Groton Public Library *102 & 52 Newtown Rd, Groton, CT *optional	\$250.00		no bid